
BRUNEI DARUSSALAM GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

No. S 26 

POST OFFICE ACT 
{CHAPTER 52) 

POST OFFICE {AMENDMENT) RULES, 2000 

In exercise of the power conferred by section 97 of the Post Offi.ce 
Act, the Minister of Communications with the approval of His 
Majesty the Sultan and Yang Di-Pertuan hereby makes the following 
Rules-

1. These Rules may be cited as the Post Offi.ce (Amendment) Rules, 
2000. 

2. Rule 53 of the Post Offi.ce Rules, 1993, in these Rules referred to 
as the principal Rules, is amended, in sub-rule (6), by deleting the 
proviso and substituting the following therefor -

"Provided that the holder of a licence shall at the time of such 
purchase present his licence together with a signed indent.". 

3. Rule 124 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting "Private 
letters, cash remittances and negotiable articles" and by substituting 
"Cash remittances" therefor. 

4. Rule 125 of the principal Rules is revoked and the following new 
rule is substituted therefor -

"~eight.and 
stze limits. 

125. The weight and size limit of each item shall be 
determined by the Postmaster General.". 

5. Rule 132 of the principal Rules is amended, in sub-rule (1), by 
adding the following -

"More than $400 a. Local 

$4.00 

b. Foreign 

$4.00 + Yz% of amount sent.". 

6. Rule 133 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting "four 
hundred" from the third line and by substituting "three thousand" 
therefor. 

Citation. 

Amendment of 
rule 53 of 
principal 
Rules. 

Amendment of 
rule 124. 

Substitution of 
rule 125. 

Amendment of 
rule 132. 

Amendment of 
rule 133. 

552 



Amendment of 
rule 148. 

553 

7. Rule 148 of the principal Rules is amended by deleting "four 
hundred" from the fourth line and by substituting "three thousand" 
therefor. 

Made this 26th. day of Zulhijah, 1420 Hijriah corresponding to 
the 1st. day of April, 2000. 

PEHIN ORANG KAYA AMAR PAHLAWAN DATO SERI SETIA 
AWANG HAJI ZAKARIA BIN DATU MAHAWANGSA 

AWANG HAJI SULAIMAN 
Minister of Communications, 

Brunei Darussalam. 




