(e

11th. FEBRUARY, 2012

No.§5

CONSTITUTION OF BRUNEI DARUSSALAM
{Order made under Article 83{3))

HALAL CERTIFICATE AND HALAL LABEL (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2012

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Section

1.

37

Citation.

Amendment of section 2 of § 39/05.
Amendment of section 6.
Amendment of section 7.

Insertion of new section 42B.
Amendment of section 46,

Substitution of Fourth Schedule.




BRUNEI DARUSSALAM GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

CONSTITUTION OF BRUNEI DARUSSALAM
{Order made under Article 83(3)

HALAL CERTIFICATE AND HALAL LABEL (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2012
In exercise of the power conferred by Article 83{3] of the Constitution of

Brunei Darussalam, His Majesty the Sultan and Yang Di-Pertuan hereby makes
the following Order —

Citation.

1. This Order may be cited as the Halal Certificate and Halal Label
[Amendment} Order, 2012.

Amendment of section 2 of § 39/05.
2. Section 2 of the Halal Certificate and Halal Label Order, 2005, in this Order

referred to as the principal Order, is amended by inserting the following new
definition immediately before the definition of “certificate” —

(%3

applicant” means a person who makes an application under section 4(1} or
10{1);”.

Amendment of section 6.

3. Section 6 of the principal Order is amended, in subsection (2}, by deleting
“one year” and by substituting “3 years” therefor.

Amendment of section 7,

4, Section 7 of the principal Order is amended, in subsection (2}, by deleting
“one year” and by substituting “3 years” therefor.

Insertion of new section 42B.

5. The principal Order is amended by inserting the following new section
immediately after section 42A —

“Display of notices.
42B.  An applicant shall, if so directed by the Majlis, display such notices in

such places, phrase them in such manner or cause them to be of such size, as
the Majlis may consider fit.”.

38



11th. FEBRUARY, 2012

Amendment of section 46,
6, Section 46 of the principal Order is amended —

fa} in the section heading, by inserting “or a permit” immediately after
“certificate”;

{b] in subsection {1} —

{if by inserting “or permit” immediately after “certificate™ in the
first line;

{ii} by inserting “or a replacement permit” immediately after
“certificate” in the first time it appears in the second last line;

{iii) by inserting “or replacement permit” immediately after
“certificate” in the second time it appears in the second last
line;

{c} in subsection {2} —

{i} by inserting “or a replacement permit” immediately after
“certificate” in the first line; .

(i) by inserting “or permit” immediately after “certificate”
wherever it appears in the last two lines.

Substitution of Fourth Schedule.

7. The principal Order is amended by repealing the Fourth Schedule and by
substituting the following new Fourth Schedule therefor —

. “FOURTH SCHEDULE {sections 6(1}, 12{1},
43(5}, 45 and 46(1})
FEES
Issue or renewal of Halal Certificate $90
Issue or replacement of Halal Certificate or permit $10
Issue of permit $50.

39



BRUNEI DARUSSALAM GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

Made this 6th. day of Rabiulawal, 1433 Hijriah corresponding to the
30th. day of January, 2012 at Our Istana Nurul Iman, Bandar Seri Begawan,
Brunei Darussalam.

HIS MAJESTY
THE SULTAN AND YANG DI-PERTUAN
BRUNEI DARUSSALAM

Dicetak oleh PENGIRAN HAJI ZAINAL ABIDIN BIN PENGIRAN SERI WIJAYA
PENGIRAN HAJI AHMAD, Pengarah Percetakan,
di Jabatan Percetakan Kerajaan, Bandar Seri Begawan BB3510, Negara Brunei Darussalam.

Harga B$5.00





