30th. AUGUST, 2008

No. S 83

MONEY-CHANGING AND REMITTANCE BUSINESSES ACT
(CHAPTER 174)

MONEY-CHANGING AND REMITTANCE BUSINESSES (LICENCE FEES) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 2008
ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS
Regulation
1. Citation and deemed date of commencement.

2. Amendment of regulation 2.

2531



BRUNEI DARUSSALAM GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

MONEY-CHANGING AND REMITTANCE BUSINESSES ACT
(CHAPTER 174)

MONEY-CHANGING AND REMITTANCE BUSINESSES (LICENCE FEES) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS, 2008

In exercise of the power conferred by section 18 of the Money-Changing and
Remittance Businesses Act, the Minister of Finance, being the Authority, hereby
makes the following Regulations —

Citation and deemed date of commencement.

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Money-Changing and Remittance
Businesses {Licence Fees) {[Amendment} Regulations, 2008 and shall be deemed to
have commenced on 1st. January, 2004.

Amendment of regulation 2.

2. Regulation 2 of the Money-Changing and Remittance Businesses (Licence
Fees) Regulations is amended —

{a) in paragraph fa), by deleting "$1,000.00" and by substituting
"$2,000" therefor:

(b} in paragraph (b}, by deleting "$500.00" and by substituting "$3,000"
therefor.

Made this 24th. day of Syaaban, 1429 Hijriah corresponding to the 26th. day
of August, 2008.

PEHIN ORANG KAYA LAILA SETIA DATO SERI SETIA
AWANG HAJI ABDUL RAHMAN BIN HAJI IBRAHIM
Authority.

Dicetak olech PENGIRAN HAJI ZAINAL ABIDIN BIN PENGIRAN SERI WIJAYA
PENGIRAN HAJI AHMAD, Pemangku Pengarah Percetakan,
di Jabatan Percetakan Kerajaan, Bandar Seri Begawan BB3510, Negara Brunei Darussalam.

Harga B$5.00



